
I am my brother’s keeper.

As a member of the Haverford 
School community, I am a man of 
integrity who embodies respect, 
honesty, and courage. 

I recognize my responsibility to care 
for, respect, and support all members 
of the Haverford community by 
practicing empathy, kindness, and 
compassion. 

If I learn of or witness mistreatment 
of others, including incidents of 
bullying, prejudicial behavior, and 
hateful language or actions, I will 
report those incidents to my Division 
Head, Dean of Students, and/or 
email equity@haverford.org.



I am my brother’s keeper.

I will bring any concern about a 
fellow student’s drug or alcohol 
use, or concerns about a student’s 
possible self-harm, to the attention of 
my Division Head, Dean of Students, 
School Counselor, or another trusted 
member of the faculty. 

The School will not pursue any 
disciplinary action, but instead will 
bring the information to the student, 
without naming its source, and will 
provide him with the resources and 
support he might need. 

In a medical emergency, call 911.
For support, call our School 
Counselor at 484-417-2715.


